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jayhermansonrotary@gmail.com

From: jayhermansonrotary@gmail.com
Sent: Thursday, May 22, 2025 11:42 AM
To: 'Christina Bell'; griffen.imig@primelending.com; 'Julie Tisdale'
Subject: FW: DACdb Corporate Payment Confirmation

Griffin/Julie:  This is an approved item under the Rotaract initiative that I put on my credit card.  Can I get 
reimbursement for this? 
 
Christie:  Can you include in the grant portal?  This has now been paid.  
 
Jay  
 
From: DACdb, LLC <noreply@froogalpay.com>  
Sent: Thursday, May 22, 2025 7:04 AM 
To: JayHermansonrotary@gmail.com 
Subject: DACdb Corporate Payment Confirmation 
 

 

DACdb Corporate 

9900 Poplar Tent Road, Suite 115 #427 
Concord, North Carolina 28027 
United States 

8333223248 

05-22-2025 

Payment Confirmation / Receipt: 

Confirmation #: 142008439867 

Account: ************1372 

Exp:  0230 

Account Type: MasterCard 

Amount ($): 40.00 

Name : Anchorage Rotaract 
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Street Address: 5980 Yukon Rd 
City: Anchorage  
State: AK 

Zip Code: 99507 

Invoice Number: 67112  

Purchase Order: FP64CF2349 

Thank you for your Business 

  


