From: Harry McSteen

To: Johnson, Don; Harry McSteen (hrmcsteen@gmail.com)
Cc: Noreen Dollinger (Noreen.dollinger@gmail.com
Subject: RE: P4334 - Final Report Form Needed
Date: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 8:14:31 AM
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Don,

| can confirm that we received $1,515.00. It was deposited on 10/12/22. Below is a copy of the cancelled check
paying for the 3 students that attended RYLA. | did not apply for the grant so | don’t know anything about the
parameters of the grant. Not sure what our obligations were/are for the remaining $505.00 of funds.
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From: Johnson, Don <Don.Johnson@Busey.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 29, 2022 8:05 AM
To: Harry McSteen (hrmcsteen@gmail.com) <hrmcsteen@gmail.com>; Harry McSteen
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<hmcsteen@midlandsb.com>
Cc: Noreen Dollinger (Noreen.dollinger@gmail.com) <noreen.dollinger@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: P4334 - Final Report Form Needed

EXTERNAL MESSAGE: Do not click any links or open any attachments unless you trust the sender and know the

content is safe.

Hi Harry,

Please see the email below. I believe that you said that we received the DDF grant check in the
amount of $1,515, correct? I sounds like we might need a copy of the check or receipt? And we used
those funds in October to send 3 students to RYLA, correct?

Thanks,
Don

Don J. Johnson

Vice President | Commercial Portfolio Manager II
2801 Black Road

Joliet, IL 60435

P: 815.733.7002 | Ext: 37002

Busey AMERICA'S Best Banks

EEST BANKS to Work For

From: Karen Swinger <karen@midwestmanage.com>
Sent: Monday, November 28, 2022 4:23 PM

To: noreen.dollinger@gmail.com

Cc: Johnson, Don <Don.Johnson@Busey.com>
Subject: P4334 - Final Report Form Needed

Mimecast Attachment Protection has deemed this file to be safe, but always exercise caution when opening files.

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Hi Noreen,

| am following up to confirm your Club's RYLA project was conducted in October. If so, and in
order to close out the project, we will need the attached Final Report Form completed and
uploaded to Matchinggrants, in addition to receipts and any photos you may have. | am
attaching a copy for your use.

If you can complete and upload to Matchinggrants this week it would be greatly appreciated.

Let me know if | can provide any assistance or answer any questions.

Thanks, Karen
District Grants Coordinator

Karen Swinger, MBA


tel:815.733.7002
https://protect-us.mimecast.com/s/bHzDCpY7BDFX1KRxIPm7yn?domain=nam10.safelinks.protection.outlook.com
mailto:karen@midwestmanage.com
mailto:noreen.dollinger@gmail.com
mailto:Don.Johnson@Busey.com

Contract COO | Midwest Management Services, LLC
Board Director | Of Color. Inc.

District Grants Coordinator | Rotary International District 6450
Marketing Committee | Rotary Club of Oak Park-River Forest
Get your FREE copy of "5 Steps to Running a Healthy Small Business" today!

The information contained in this e-mail is privileged and confidential. Unless otherwise indicated or
obvious from the message, this is intended only for the individual(s) listed above. Please see our
Privacy Notices at http://www.busey.com.
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