————————— Forwarded message ---——-

From: Mia Carter <mcarter@villageofmatteson.org>

Date: Wed, Jul 27, 2022 at 2:56 PM

Subject: RE: One final piece to close Matteson's District Grant# P-3869 - Classroom Innovation Dsitrict
Grant

To: Lesley Gottlinger <bookgramma@gmail.com>

# P-3869 - Classroom Innovation District Grant

District Grant P-3869

Currently, we do not have a copy of the cancelled check or the bank statement
indicating the check has cleared the bank. When we are able (with bank cooperation), to
send a copy of the cancelled check that the club sent to the school district for $179.70,
as the cleared check becomes available from the bank, we will be happy to do so.

Mia Carter

President Matteson Rotary



