Rachel Ossyra Jun 29, 2020, 5:46
PM (22 hours ago)

to me, Paul

Hello Sue,

Could you please help Paul to post this proof of payment for the Homewood Buddy
Bench to the project folder P-2826 online.

Thanks,

Rachel Ossyra

Rotary International District 6450

President, Rotary Club of Naperville 2019-20
District Rotary Foundation Chair 2019-22
District Grants Chair 2016-19

Mobile: 1.630.544.4927
RachelMarieO@hotmail.com

Together, we see a world where people unite and take action to create lasting change
- across the globe, in our communities, and in ourselves.

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Donohue, Paul [ING]" <pdonohue@ingalls.org>

Date: June 29, 2020 at 4:48:10 PM CDT

To: "rachelmarieo@hotmail.com” <rachelmarieo@hotmail.com>

Subject: FW: Belson Outdoors Transaction Receipt - Reference Number
326995283

Rachel,

FYI

Please advise where else | need to post this payment confirmation information?
Thx.

PDo

Paul Donohue, CFRE, MBA | VP, Philanthropy & Community Relations
INGALLS DEVELOPMENT FOUNDATION
One Ingalls Drive, Harvey, IL 60426

Office: 708.915.6115 | Direct: 708.915.6118
Email: pdonohue@ingalls.org | Web: www.ingallsfoundation.org
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Make a Gift!

From: Teri Brenner [mailto:teri.brenner@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, June 29, 2020 4:38 PM

To: Paul Styles <pwsjr40@yahoo.com>; Donohue, Paul [ING] <pdonohue@ingalls.org>; Lisa
GannCampbell <vualpha88@gmail.com>; Tyler Burlison <tyburlison@gmail.com>; Geoff Slawson
<tgsvideo-homewoodrotary@yahoo.com>

Cc: Mitchell, Dale <dale.mitchell@hsd153.org>

Subject: Fwd: Belson Outdoors Transaction Receipt - Reference Number 326995283

Hello everyone: here is the confirmation email/invoice from Belson Outdoors dated
today. Payment has been made in full for the Buddy Bench. The latest they can deliver
is the last week of August. | was unable to reach Dale Mitchell to confirm delivery to
school so it is being delivered to my house.

Payment is as follows:

$450: Grant
$695: President's Discretionary Fund (PDF)

$106: Balance PDF

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Belson Outdoors <notifications@paytrace.com>

Date: Mon, Jun 29, 2020 at 3:58 PM

Subject: Belson Outdoors Transaction Receipt - Reference Number 326995283
To: <teri.brenner@gmail.com>
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(800) 323-5664
Belson Outdoors
627 Amersale Drive
Naperville, IL 60563
800-323-5664



Reference Number:

Total:
Transaction Type:

Transaction Status:

Card Brand:

Card Number:
Entry Method:
Approval Code:
Approval Message:
AVS Result:

CSC Result:
Customer Name:
Invoice:

6/29/2020 3:57:29 PM
mj@belson.com

326995283
$1,144.94

Sale

Pending Settlement
MasterCard
XXXXXXXXXXXXA857
Keyed

02912P

ZIP MATCH

Zip Match Only
Match

WQ266570

This message and any included attachments are from Ingalls Memorial Hospital and are intended only for the addressee(s). The information
contained herein may include privileged or otherwise confidential information. Unauthorized review, forwarding, printing, copying, distributing
or using such information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you received this message in error, or have reason to believe you are
not authorized to receive it, please promptly delete this message and notify the sender by e-mail with a copy to mailsecurity@ingalls.org

Thank you
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