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PST. SILVANUS MALAHO.

1-17-19

Good evening Dian,

Thanks for your email this morning about the receipts sent to me by Pastor Malaho. | apologize that |
did not include you in the list of recipients to whom | forward the emails | received from Pastor Malaho
which included photos and receipts. The next several emails | will forward to you are those which |
received from him, replied to, and forwarded to others involved.

Below is the list of purchases he sent me when | wrote and told him | couldn’t read the faded receipts he
originally sent. He also had sent a few receipts for items that were different than what was related to
this grant. When | brought this to his attention, he apologized for the mistake and attempted to retrieve
the actual printed receipts which he told me were too faded to read. He told me that he had the
vendors write out receipts for his purchases, which he sent in a later email. | wish we had the actual
printed receipts, but | hope this information, including photos of the bedding, are sufficient
documentation.

Please let me know if | can be of further help on this Dian.

Kim

From: Silvanus malaho [mailto:smalaho77 @gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, November 16, 2018 1:51 PM

To: Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net>

Subject: Re: Beddings

Dear Friend Dr. Kim .

Thank you for your feedback.



You forwarded to me $1500, after Bank Charges and Taxes , I was paid Ksh.147,6850 .
I bought the items as follows :--

48 Mattresses @ 1450 per one =69600.

84 Pieces of Blankets (@ Ksh.550 per one.=46200.

84 Pieces of Bedsheets @ Ksh.365 per piece =30660

Total Ksh. 146460. The other amount used for transportation.

That day in the Super Market where I was purchasing the items I was lucky to meet a lady
Treasurer of Rotary Club of Kakamega. She was happy to see me with some of the children who
had requested to join me .

I owe you and all who donated special deep debt of gratitude.
Once more thank you.

PST.SILVANUS MALAHO.

On Fri, Nov 16, 2018, 07:51 Kim Baxter <kabaxter(@charter.net> wrote:

Thank you so much Pastor Malaho for sending the photos and receipts. | am having trouble reading
what is listed on the receipts and the amounts. Could you please list these items purchased and their
costs in an email that we can more clearly read? Then | will be able to share this information with our
fellow Rotarians.

Thank you Pastor,
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From: Silvanus malaho [mailto:smalaho77@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, November 19, 2018 6:37 AM

To: Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net>

Subject: Re: Beddings

Dear Friend Dr. Kim.

| have been in Kakamega in the Supermarket where | bought the Beddings and they have seen the Print
out of the Receipt it is very faint after Scanning and | have been issued with a handwritten Receipt. .
Please see the attachment. I"m sorry for all the bother . Please kindly forgive. | forwarded to you the
Receipt of Food and other items that | had purchased for the Children and | was supposed to Scan the
Receipt and forward to a friend who had sponsored the purchase of the items. Very humbly , | appeal
please forgive me.

Thank you.

PST. SILVANUS MALAHO.

On Mon, Nov 19, 2018 at 1:43 AM Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net> wrote:
That'’s fine Pastor. Thank you.

Kim

From: Silvanus malaho [mailto:smalaho77 @gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, November 18, 2018 7:52 AM

To: Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net>

Subject: Re: Beddings

Today | even delayed to go to Church because | wanted to put all receipts in order because Jane the
lady who keeps all receipts and other records had a serious domestic problem and she's out of office
until sometime next February 2019. The receipts are very faint therefore tomorrow morning | will seek the
advice from the supermarket where | bought the items because | will be very happy and thankful to
forward to you very clear and authentic receipts.

Please be patient until tomorrow.

Thank you.

Pastor S. Malaho.

On Sun, Nov 18, 2018, 00:13 Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net> wrote:
Dear Pastor Malaho,

Thank you for this added information to clarify your expenditures. I am sorry to bother you further
with this, but the copies of receipts you originally sent were not the correct ones. They are for
other items you have purchased. Could you please send copies of the receipts that match the
expenditures you have listed in this email?

Thanks again,
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Kim

From: Silvanus malaho [mailto:smalaho77 @gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, November 16,2018 1:51 PM

To: Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net>
Subject: Re: Beddings

Dear Friend Dr. Kim .

Thank you for your feedback.

You forwarded to me $1500, after Bank Charges and Taxes , | was paid Ksh.147,6850 .

| bought the items as follows :--

48 Mattresses @ 1450 per one =69600.

84 Pieces of Blankets @ Ksh.550 per one.=46200.

84 Pieces of Bedsheets @ Ksh.365 per piece =30660

Total Ksh. 146460. The other amount used for transportation.

That day in the Super Market where | was purchasing the items | was lucky to meet a lady Treasurer of
Rotary Club of Kakamega. She was happy to see me with some of the children who had requested to join
me .

| owe you and all who donated special deep debt of gratitude.

Once more thank you.

PST.SILVANUS MALAHO.

On Fri, Nov 16, 2018, 07:51 Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net> wrote:

Thank you so much Pastor Malaho for sending the photos and receipts. [ am having trouble reading
what is listed on the receipts and the amounts. Could you please list these items purchased and
their costs in an email that we can more clearly read? Then I will be able to share this information

with our fellow Rotarians.

Thank you Pastor,

Kim

From: Silvanus malaho [mailto:smalaho77 @gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, November 15, 2018 4:39 AM

To: Kim Baxter <kabaxter@charter.net>
Subject: Beddings

Dear Rotarian Friends.
| have the pleasure and with total humility and special gratitude from deep in my heart forward to you
some photographs of the items that | purchased with the funds that | received from you. | hope and
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believe they will be able to communicate positive message. In case of any questions or in need of
clarification please forward to me | will respond accordingly.

Once more thank you. | owe you special debt of gratitude from deep in my heart.

PST. SILVANUS MALAHO.

Attachments area
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